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he first Blessing preparation 
workshop in Italian language 
was organised online for both 
singles and couples who had 
already received lessons on 

DP from their Pastors or spiritual 
parents in their communities. 
The workshop was organised by the 
Blessed Family Department with the 
support of Pastors after a prayer 
condition that began 4 weeks before, 
with the goal to create a base where 
couples and singles could connect 
and understand the deep meaning of 
the Blessing and prepare themselves 
to receive the Cosmic Blessing. This 
was done to give support to CheonBo 
families and help those who wanted 
to reach this goal and qualify as 
victorious Cheonbo couples. 
The content of the lessons was based 
on the content of the European first 
level preparation workshop for first 
generation candidates and it was 
adapted to the situation of singles 
and couples in Italy. 

The lessons were based on Divine 
Principle with a deeper 
understanding of the family and 
blessing and about the foundation of 
faith and substance we should 
establish to have a new beginning 
through the blessing. 
Our goal was to reach 21 guests in 
this first workshop, and we were able 
to reach this goal in the 2 days 
workshop. Those who missed any 
part of it received the video to 
complete all the content. 
Both guests and members expressed 
their gratitude and appreciation for 
the program and content proposed to 
them, and some have already 
expressed their desire to continue 
their preparation and receive the 
blessing. 
Below you can find some of the 
comments: 
“Very deep and interesting 
explanation about Adam and Eve and 
a clear summary of history until 
today!” 
 “Thank you. The lessons today by 
Sergio, Dario and Franz have been 

lifeblood for our growth, to help us 
create a God centered family.” 
We would like to thank all those who 
helped with this workshop, 
especially the Pastors of our 
communities, and the spiritual 
parents who invited their guests and 
made this workshop possible! A big 
thanks also to the teachers Lorna and 
Giuseppe Russo, Sergio Coscia and 
Franz Kerschbaummayr who 
invested their time and hard work for 
the well prepared and valid content. 
A big thank  you also to our young 
second gen especially Robin Chionna 
and Truelove Godonou for their 
technical support and for the musical 
entertainment offered by Robin. A 
beautiful testimony of the matching 
and blessing was shared by Dario 
Biava, who was blessed in 2018 and 
is now parent with his wife Manuela 
from Albania of two beautiful twin 
girls. Dario and his wife are 
members of the committee 
responsible for the Bergamo 
community. 
The main purpose of this workshop 
was to work closely together as 
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communities and Pastors with the 
BFD to create a clear vision and 
program for both singles and couple 
towards recieving the Cosmic 
blessing. 
Reflections from some brothers and 
sisters: 
“We’d like to complement you for 
the 2 day sessions. You’ve have done 
a great job, with very deep and clear 
explanations about the meaning of 
the blessing. Thank you!”  
“It was very interesting to hear about 
the role of women in history.” 
“Hello Patrizia, Franz, Giuseppe and 
Lorna, 

Thank you! We were waiting so long 
for this type of workshop. From the 
beginning of the pandemic, we were 
following many wonderful seminars 
online but all in English language. If 
our contacts spoke English, it was ok 
but what about the others? Poor Italy 
I thought to myself. Thank heavens 
and you for this great initiative, 
you’re a wonderful team! 
“I liked Lorna’s lesson, her accent 
and background. All the lessons were 
well prepared. The explanation of the 
Blessing was clear and well done. 
It’s not easy to summarize DP in 
short lessons so my compliments go 
to Giuseppe and Sergio. The lesson 
Franz gave was very useful to 

conclude. I like listening to his 
lessons with his accent and calm tone 
of voice. Now Italy has become 
international! 
I’m very grateful for the great 
teamwork you’ve done and for this 
workshop. Thanks for your efforts 
and hard work for Heavenly Parents. 
Let’s work together to bring one 
third of Italy to God by 2027. 
God bless all of you for your deep 
heart.” 
With great hope we look forward to 
the second level Blessing preparation 
and we’d like to thank you all!! 
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